
AMERICAN 

PROGRESSIVISM 



THE GOALS OF 

PROGRESSIVISM 



LET’S SET THE SCENE! 



reforms of the gilded age carry over 

into the 20th century 

there’s a drive to reform big business 

and working conditions 

intellectuals seek to make 

government more responsive 



A period (1870s - 1910s ) that aimed to return 

control of government back to the COMMON 

PEOPLE, restore EQUAL ECONOMIC 

OPPORTUNITY, and CORRECT SOCIAL 

INJUSTICES 

PROMOTE MORAL IMPROVEMENT in society 

4 MAIN GOALS OF PROGRESSIVISM 

PROTECT SOCIAL WELFARE of citizens 

CREATE ECONOMIC REFORM nationwide 

FOSTER EFFICIENCY in industry 



’

PROTECTING SOCIAL 
WELFARE 



Social Welfare 
Inspired by Social Gospel Movement 

& rooted in Judeo-Christian beliefs 
charity is at heart of Americana 

opened libraries, pools, gave 
education & beds to needy boys 

goal 

YMCA & Salvation army 

opened soup kitchens for hungry, 
nurseries for needy children 

advocated better lives for women 
& children 

Florence kelley 

Provide charity to the needy 

to ensure every American 

lives well! 



promoting moral 
improvement 



moral improvement 
Some reformers thought morality, 

not wealth, would improve lives 
living morally would uplift the 
poor, give them purpose/drive 

based on Christianity, they 
sang/prayed in saloons 

Women’s Christian 

Temperance Union (WCTU) 

Took her hatchets to bottles in 
saloons 

carry nation 

they opened schools, went to 
prisons, talked about sobriety  

gave credibility to women’s suffrage 







’

economic 
opportunity 



economic reform 
Economic Panic of 1893 leads many 

Americans to question capitalism 

journalists who wrote about 
corruption of big business, life 

muckrakers 

caused backlash vs. businessmen, 
wealthy, corporate greed 

workers, citizens clamored for 
worker-based economy & equal 
distribution of wealth 

Socialism 

reform business, better working 
conditions 



’

fostering 
efficiency 



Reformers pushed use of science, 

expert advice in manufacturing 

make industry more efficient, 
reduce waste, satisfy more needs 

break work into small tasks, all 
workers do one thing very well 

result? 
Despite complications w/ 

workers, productivity increases 

Industry turns to scientific 

management 

This also to fatigued workforce  
workers became overworked, injured 
easily 

efficiency in industry 



political machines and corrupt mayors 

were thrown out 

state governors were held 

responsible for public works 

reforms turned to elections to 

make officials accountable 



reforming elections 
Reformers initiated reforms to make 

officials more responsive to voters 

prevented voter fraud 
secret ballot 

voters can directly write a bill and 
put in on the ballot for passage 

voters vote on an ballot initiative 
referendum 

Initiative 

voters can remove officials from 
office early or call an election 

recall 

changed Constitution to allow 
direct election of U.S. senators 

seventeenth amendment (1912) 





 1) The Goals of Progressivism 
 

2) The Roots of the Progressive Movement 
 

3) Election Reform 

CLOSURE 

Write THREE things you 

learned today about


